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
STAFF REPORT/RESOLUTION 

TO: Southwest Washington Regional Transportation Council Board of Directors 

FROM: Matt Ransom, Executive Director   

DATE: September 26, 2017 

SUBJECT: RTC – CITY OF VANCOUVER Master Interlocal Services Agreement,  
Resolution 10-17-15 

AT A GLANCE - ACTION 
The RTC is authorized to contract on a fee-for-service basis with member agencies to provide 
specialty and project management services.  RTC and the City of Vancouver are proposing to 
enter into a Master Interlocal Services Agreement (Agreement) to establish a contracting 
relationship.  Approval of the Agreement establishes a contract and framework for 
accomplishing mutually beneficial work efforts.    

INTRODUCTION 
The Southwest Washington Regional Transportation Council (RTC) was organized in 1992 
through an Interlocal Agreement among signatory (member) agencies.  The Interlocal Agreement 
provides that RTC may contract on a fee-for-service basis with parties to the agreement and with 
non-party agencies and private entities which will provide special services.   

The Year 2017 Work Program for the RTC provides that RTC will seek opportunities for 
regional partnership and collaboration, and fee-for-service project management relationships. 
The proposed Master Interlocal Services Agreement (Agreement) between RTC and CITY OF 
VANCOUVER would provide a formal contracting mechanism to accomplish work order(s) and 
reimbursement for services rendered.  RTC and CITY OF VANCOUVER find it mutually 
advantageous to utilize the other’s personnel and expertise, when appropriate, to increase 
efficiency and provide specialty transportation planning and project management services.   

Adoption of Resolution 10-17-15 provides a contracting relationship between RTC and CITY 
OF VANCOUVER to accomplish defined work order(s) and to provide reimbursement for 
services rendered. 

POLICY IMPLICATION 
Upon approval of the Resolution and the Master Interlocal Services Agreement, the executive 
officers of each agency may enter into work orders and seek reimbursement for services 
rendered. 

BUDGET IMPLICATION 
None.  Each party requesting service, covenants by executing a work order pursuant to the 
Agreement, that it has (or will) have sufficient resources to reimburse the other party for services 
rendered. 
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